
 
Brady’s Core Values   *   Safety   *   Integrity   *   Excellence   *   Accountability   *   Teamwork 

         CITY OF BRADY COUNCIL AGENDA 
REGULAR CITY COUNCIL MEETING 

FEBRUARY 21, 2023 AT 6:00 PM 
 

 
 
 
 
 

1.  CALL TO ORDER, ROLL CALL & CERTIFICATION OF A QUORUM 
      
2.  INVOCATION & PLEDGE OF ALLEGIANCE 

 

3.  PUBLIC COMMENTS: Reserved for items NOT listed on the agenda 
Please limit individual public comments to three (3) minutes.  In accordance with TX AG opinion, any 
public comment addressing items not on the agenda, will only be heard by the City Council.   No formal 
action, deliberation, discussion, or comment will be made by City Council.  State Law prohibits any 
deliberation or decisions regarding items presented in public comments. City Council may only make a 
statement of specific factual information given in response to the inquiry; recite an existing policy; or 
request staff to place the item on an agenda for a subsequent meeting.  

4.  CONSENT AGENDA:  Reserved for routine items to save time 
Any item may be removed from the Consent Agenda at the request of a Council Member and 
considered separately following the Consent Agenda approval.  All items listed on the Consent Agenda 
are to be with one motion “Move to approve Consent Agenda.” 
 

A. Approval of Minutes Regular Meeting on February 7, 2023 
 
 
 

 
 

5. PRESENTATIONS 

 
➢ Water Tank Maintenance Program 

 
 
 
 
 

6.  PUBLIC HEARING: 

 
None 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 

Vacant 
Mayor 

 
Larry Land 

Council Member Place 1  
 

Missi Elliston 
Council Member Place 2 

 
Jeffrey Sutton 

Council Member Place 3 
 

Jane Huffman 
Mayor Pro Tem 

Council Member Place 4 
 

Jay May 
Council Member Place 5 

 

 
Erin Corbell 

City Manager 
 

Tina Keys 
City Secretary 

 
Sharon Hicks 
City Attorney 

 

 

MISSION 
The City of Brady 

strives to share its 

history and encourage 
the development of 

diverse housing, 
employment, 

infrastructure, and 
opportunity through 

transparent 

management and 
financing for all 

residents and 
employees. 

 

NOTICE is hereby given of a meeting of the City Council of City of Brady, McCulloch County, 
State of Texas, to be held at 6:00 p.m. February 21, 2023, at the City of Brady Municipal Court 
Building located 207 S. Elm St., Brady, Texas, for the purpose of considering the following 
items.  The City Council of the City of Brady, Texas, reserves the right to meet in closed session 
on any of the items listed below should the need arise and if applicable pursuant to 
authorization by Title 5, Chapter 551, of the Texas Government Code. 



CITY OF BRADY COUNCIL AGENDA 
REGULAR CITY COUNCIL MEETING 

FEBRUARY 21, 2023, 6:00 P.M. 

7.  INDIVIDUAL CONCERNS 

City Council Members are to deliberate the following items.  Staff will present the item and are prepared to answer City Council 
Member questions.  The Mayor will recognize Council Members as the council discuss the item so everyone is heard.  Once the City 
Council Members finish discussion, the Mayor will recognize attendees who have comments.  Attendees and council members need 
to direct comments to the Mayor as they are recognized.  When all comments are complete, the Mayor will call for a motion.   

A. Discussion, consideration and possible action regarding the second reading of Ordinance 1352 of 
the City of Brady, Texas, to amend the FY2023 Budget, by increasing the capital expenditure budget 
in the Water/Sewer Fund 30 to support a bid award.  ($75,800)    

B. Discussion, consideration and possible action regarding recommendation for the new Airport EST 
(water tank) logo 

C. Discussion, consideration and possible action on awarding lowest responsive bid of $398,300 to 
Horseshoe Construction, Inc., La Porte, TX, for the Oak St. San Jacento sewer line improvement 
project, TX-CDBG Brady CDV21-0068 

D. Discussion, consideration and possible action to approve Hotel Occupancy Tax (HOT) funding 
application from the TruCountry Music Show to be held April 7-8, 2023 

E. Discussion, consideration and possible action to approve Hotel Occupancy Tax (HOT) funding 
application from the Heart of Texas Country Music Association for the annual Heart of Texas Music 
Festival to be held March 23 – April 1, 2023 

F. Discussion, consideration and possible action to approve the use of City held Hotel Occupancy Tax 
funds to support production costs for “Cal’s Hometown Revival” 
 

8. STAFF REPORTS 

A. Monthly Financial / Utility Reports 
B. Monthly Activity Reports:  Seniors, Golf, BPD, Fire-EMS Calls, BVFD Expense Report, Animal 

Control, Airport, Code Enforcement, Municipal Court 
C. Upcoming Special Events/Meetings:  

March 1  Annual City Employee Chili Cook off – 11:30 a.m., Senior Center 

March 7  Regular City Council Meeting, 6:00 

Mar 13 – 17  BISD Spring Break 

March 21  Regular City Council Meeting, 6:00 
 

9.  ANNOUNCEMENTS 
Pursuant to the Texas Government Code § 551.0415, City Council Members and City staff may make reports about items of community interest 
during a meeting of the governing body without having given notice of the report. Items of community interest include: Expressions of thanks, 
congratulations, or condolence; an honorary or salutary recognition of a public official, public employee, or other citizen, except that a discussion 
regarding a change in the status of a person’s public office or public employment is not an honorary or salutary recognition for purposes of this 
subdivision; Information regarding a social, ceremonial, or community event organized or sponsored by an entity other than the governing body that 
was attended or is scheduled to be attended by a member of the governing body or an official or employee of the municipality; and announcements 
involving an imminent threat to public health and safety of people in the municipality that has arisen after the posting of the agenda. 
 

10.  EXECUTIVE SESSION 

 
The City Council of the City of Brady will adjourn into Executive Session for the following: 

• Pursuant to Section 551.071 (Consultation with Attorney), the City Council will consult with the 
City Attorney about pending or contemplated litigation or on a matter in which the duty of the 
attorney to the City under the Texas Disciplinary Rules of Professional Conduct of the State Bar of 
Texas clearly conflicts with the Texas Open Meetings Act:   

• Pursuant to Section 551.074 (Personnel Matters) City Council will meet to deliberate the 
appointment, employment, evaluation, reassignment, duties, discipline or dismissal of a public 
officer or employee:  Employee Evaluations - Acting Police Chief / Fire Chief  

11.  OPEN SESSION ACTION ON ANY ITEMS COMING OUT OF EXECUTIVE SESSION 



CITY OF BRADY COUNCIL AGENDA 
REGULAR CITY COUNCIL MEETING 

FEBRUARY 21, 2023, 6:00 P.M. 

Discussion, consideration or possible action as a result of Executive Session, if any. 
 

12. ADJOURNMENT 

I certify that this is a true and correct copy of the City of Brady City Council Meeting Agenda and that this notice as posted on the 
designated bulletin board at Brady City Hall, 201 E. Main St., Brady, Texas 76825; a place convenient and readily accessible to the 
public at all times, and said notice was posted on _________________ by 6:00 p.m. and will remain posted continuously for 72 hours 
prior to the scheduled meeting pursuant to Chapter 551 of the Texas Government Code.   
 
 
_____________________ 
 
Tina Keys, City Secretary 
 

In compliance with the American with Disabilities Act, the City of Brady will provide for reasonable accommodations for persons 
attending public meetings at City facilities.  Requests for accommodations or interpretive services must be received at least 48 
hours prior to the meeting.  Please contact the City Secretary at 325-597-2152 or tkeys@bradytx.us  
  
     Attendance by Other Elected or Appointed Officials:  It is anticipated that members of other governmental bodies, and/or city boards, commissions 
and/or committees may attend the meeting in numbers that may constitute a quorum of the body, board, commission and/or committee.  The 
members of the boards, commissions and/or committees may be permitted to participate in discussion on the same items listed on the agenda, 
which occur at the meeting, but no action will be taken by such in attendance unless item and action is specifically provided for on an agenda for 
that body, board, commission or committee subject to the Texas Open Meetings Act.   
     The City Council of the City of Brady reserves the right to adjourn into Executive Session at any time during the course of this meeting to discuss 
any of the matters listed on this agenda as authorized by the Texas Government Code Sections 551.071 (Consultation with Attorney), 551.072 
(Deliberations regarding Real Property), 551.073 (Deliberations regarding prospective Gifts or Donations), 551.074 (Personnel Matters), 551.076 
(Deliberations regarding Security Devices), 551.086 (Deliberate, vote or take final action on competitive matters of the public power utility), and 
551.087 (Deliberation regarding Economic Development). 
    This agenda has been reviewed and approved by the City’s legal counsel and the presence of any subject in any Executive Session portion of the 
agenda constitutes written interpretation of the Texas Government Code Chapter 551 by legal counsel for the governmental body and constitutes 
an opinion by the attorney that the items discussed therein may be legally discussed in the closed portion of the meeting considering available 
opinions of a court of record and opinions of the Texas Attorney General known to the attorney.  This provision has been added to this agenda with 
the intent to meet all elements necessary to satisfy Texas Government Code Chapter 551.104(c) and the meeting is conducted by all participants in 
reliance on this opinion. 

 

 

mailto:tkeys@bradytx.us
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 STATE OF TEXAS        

 

COUNTY OF McCULLOCH 

 

CITY OF BRADY 

 

The City Council of the City of Brady, Texas met in a Regular Meeting on Tuesday February 7, 2023 at 6:00 p.m. with 

Mayor Pro Tem Huffman presiding.  Council Members present were Missi Elliston, Larry Land, Jay May, Jeffrey 

Sutton and Jane Huffman.  City staff present were City Manager Erin Corbell, Public Works Director Steven Miller, 

Acting Police Chief Randy Batten, and City Secretary Tina Keys.  Also in attendance were Lance & Charla May, Lisa 

Selensky, Lawrence Selensky, Gabe Moreno and Tessa Bradshaw. 

 

1.  CALL TO ORDER, ROLL CALL & CERTIFICATION OF A QUORUM 

Mayor Pro Tem Huffman called the meeting to order at 6:00 p.m.  Council quorum was certified.   

2.  INVOCATION AND PLEDGE OF ALLEGIANCE 

Charla May gave the invocation, and the Pledge of Allegiance was recited. 

3.  PUBLIC COMMENTS 

There were no public comments 

4.  CONSENT AGENDA 

A. Approval of Minutes for Regular Meeting on January 17, 2022. 

 

Council Member Elliston moved to approve the Consent Agenda.  Seconded by Council Member May.  All 

Council Members voted “aye” and none “nay”.  Motion passed with a 5 – 0 vote. 

 

5.  PRESENTATIONS: 

There were no presentations 

6.  PUBLIC HEARINGS AND INDIVIDUAL CONCERNS ON PUBLIC HEARING  

There were no public hearings 

7.  INDIVIDUAL CONCERNS 

A. Discussion, consideration and possible action regarding the first reading of Ordinance 1352 of the City of 

Brady, Texas to amend the FY2023 Budget, by increasing the capital expenditure budget in the 

Water/Sewer Fund 30 to support a bid award. ($75,800).  Lisa McElrath presented with Steven Miller 

assisting.  Council Member Elliston asked if we declined this grant, would it affect future grants.  Miller 

said it could.  Miller said we would have a disconnect if the amendment was not approved.  Council 

Member Huffman said the CDGB is federal money.  Miller said our agreement is with the Texas 

Department of Agriculture.  Council Member Huffman asked if we have to register with SAM.gov.  Lisa 

said yes.  Council Member Huffman said that needs to be on the next agenda.  Miller said if we don’t 

approve the first reading tonight, the contractor only has to hold his price for 60 days and we’re about a 

third into that time frame.  Lisa said we could approve the budget amendment then clarify at the next 

meeting and said we can’t award the bid with this approval because we still have to come back to council.  

Council Member Huffman said we have plenty of money to fund it.  In order to continue to receive 

funding, the City is required to register on a website with the same terminology as the APRA fund 

agreement.  Council Member Huffman said Erin Corbell is looking into it.  Council Member Huffman said 

she doesn’t want registration on that website without council analyzing it.  Council Member May said 
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we’re going to do this whether we do this grant or not.  Council Member Elliston said worse case scenario, 

we would have to pay the full amount.  Council Member Huffman said council needs to be aware that the 

same verbiage is on the SAM.gov agreement.  Council Member Elliston asked if we have registered with 

SAM.gov before.  Lisa said we’ve done it for years.  Lisa said it’s her understanding it’s a data gathering 

system.  Council Member Huffman said she was told by city staff that there is new verbiage.  Lisa said 

we’ve had another staff member in charge of keeping that active.  Council Member Elliston said even if we 

approve the amendment tonight, it’s not final.  Lisa said we have to establish if we will spend money on 

this project or not.  Council Member Huffman wants to make sure approving the budget amendment does 

not give the ok to register on the website.  Council Member May moved to approve the first reading of 

Ordinance 1352.    Seconded by Council Member Elliston.  All Council Members voted “aye” and none 

“nay”.  Motion passed with a 5 – 0 vote. 

B. Discussion, consideration and possible action regarding approval of Resolution 2023-003 to call May 6, 

2023 General Election for the purpose of filling City of Brady City Council Members Place 4 and 5 expiring 

terms.  Tina Keys presented.  Council Member Sutton moved to approve Resolution 2023-003.  Seconded 

by Council Member Elliston.  All Council Members voted “aye” and none “nay”.  Motion passed with a 5 – 

0 vote. 

C. Discussion, consideration and possible action regarding approval of Resolution 2023-004 to call May 6, 

2023 Special Election to fill a vacancy for the purpose of filling City of Brady Mayor unexpired term.  Tina 

Keys presented.  Council Member Sutton moved to approve Resolution 2023-004.  Seconded by Council 

Member Elliston.  All Council Members voted “aye” and none “nay”.  Motion passed with a 5 – 0 vote. 

D. Discussion, consideration and possible action regarding approval of Resolution 2023-005 to enter into a 

finance contract with Government Capital for the purpose of procuring (2) Police vehicles ($58,000).  Lisa 

McElrath presented.  Council Member Elliston moved to approve Resolution 2023-005 to enter into a 

finance contract with Government Capital Corporation for a total principal amount not to exceed $58,000.  

Seconded by Council Member May.  All Council Members voted “aye” and none “nay”.  Motion passed 

with a 5 – 0 vote. 

 

8.  STAFF REPORTS 

A. Upcoming Special Events/Meetings:  

February 20  President’s Day Holiday, City offices closed, altered trash schedule 

February 21  Regular City Council Meeting, 6:00 p.m. 

March 7  Regular City Council Meeting, 6:00 p.m. 

March 21  Regular City Council Meeting, 6:00 p.m. 

   
 

9.  ANNOUNCEMENTS 

Council Member Huffman said Hope from the Heart is next Saturday the 18th.  Council Member Elliston said the 

Child Welfare Board will have their car show the 3rd Saturday in April.  It’s a very important event for that board.  It 

takes care of all McCulloch County children who are in foster care.   

10.  EXECUTIVE SESSION 

The City Council of the City of Brady adjourned into Executive Session for the following: 

 Pursuant to Section 551.071 (Consultation with Attorney), the City Council will consult with the City 

Attorney about pending or contemplated litigation or on a matter in which the duty of the attorney to the 

City under the Texas Disciplinary Rules of Professional Conduct of the State Bar of Texas clearly conflicts 

with the Texas Open Meetings Act:   

 

There was no executive session. 

 



3 | P a g e  –  B r a d y  C i t y  C o u n c i l  M i n u t e s  F e b r u a r y  7 ,  2 0 2 3  

 

11.  OPEN SESSION ACTION ON ANY ITEMS COMING OUT OF EXECUTIVE SESSION 

n/a 

12.  ADJOURNMENT 

There being no further business, Mayor Pro Tem Huffman adjourned the meeting at 6:26 p.m. 

 

 

 

____________________________ 

Jane Huffman, Mayor Pro Tem     

Attest: __________________________ 

Tina Keys, City Secretary 



PUBLIC WATER STORAGE 
TANK MAINTENANCE 

PROGRAM



TEXAS COMMISSION ON ENVIRONMENTAL QUALITY
(TCEQ)

RULE §290.46 MINIMUM ACCEPTABLE OPERATING 

PRACTICES FOR PUBLIC DRINKING WATER SYSTEMS

(1) EACH OF THE SYSTEM'S GROUND, ELEVATED, AND 

PRESSURE TANKS SHALL BE INSPECTED ANNUALLY BY WATER 

SYSTEM PERSONNEL OR A CONTRACTED INSPECTION 

SERVICE.



BACKGROUND
• FIRST TEN(10) – YEAR CONTRACT AGREEMENT

• ESTABLISHED IN 2013 W/ UTILITY SERVICES CO., INC.

• COMPRISED OF TEN (10) WATER STORAGE TANKS

• PROGRAM CONSISTED OF TWO TYPES OF SERVICES
• LIMITED MAINTENANCE (6 TANKS CLEANING ONLY)

• MAINTENANCE PROJECT (4 TANKS RECEIVED PAINTING)



2013 FEE STRUCTURE
(10-YR TERM)

• TEN (10) TANKS EQUAL APPROX.  $800,000  FOR TERM

• ANNUAL PAYMENT APPROX. $80,000

• QUARTERLY PAYMENT ARRANGEMENT

• 10-YR TERM ENDING THIS FY2023



REQUEST FOR COMPETITIVE 
SEALED PROPOSALS

• BASIS OF RFP TO ENSURE FAIR COMPETITION

• COMPETITIVE PROPOSALS EVALUATED ON FOUR (4) FACTORS:
• PRICE @ 50%

• EXPERIENCE @ 20%

• TECHNICAL @ 15%

• COATING @ 15%
100%



2023 TANK MAINTENANCE RESPONSES
(10-YR TERM)

• THREE (3) SEALED PROPOSALS RECEIVED WITH RANKING APPLIED

UTILITY SERVICES CO., INC. (A VEOLIA CO.) 98.8%

VIKING INDUSTRIAL PAINTING 92.8%

D&M TANK, LLC  78.3%



NEW 10-YR TANK SUMMARY

• A TOTAL THIRTEEN (13) TANKS FOR MAINTENANCE CONTRACT

• NINE  (9) GROUND STORAGE TANKS

• TWO (2) STANDPIPES

• TWO (2) ELEVATED STORAGE TANKS



2023 TANK MAINTENANCE PRICE 
RESPONSE (10-YR TERM)

UTILITY SERVICES CO., INC. $1,141,466

VIKING INDUSTRIAL PAINTING $1,248,560

D&M TANK, LLC  $1,622,255



COMMENTS

DISCUSSION 

QUESTIONS



 

 

City Council 

City of Brady, Texas 
Agenda Action Form for Ordinance 

 

AGENDA DATE: 2-21-23 AGENDA ITEM   7.A. 

 

AGENDA SUBJECT: Discussion, consideration, and possible action regarding second reading of 
Ordinance 1352 of the City of Brady, Texas, to amend the FY2023 Budget, 
by increasing the capital expenditure budget in the Water/Sewer Fund 30 to 
support a bid award.  ($75,800)    

PREPARED BY:  L. McElrath / S. Miller Date Submitted: 2-10-23 

 

EXHIBITS: Ordinance 1352 
Fund Balance Worksheet 

 

BUDGETARY IMPACT: Required Expenditure: $398,300.00 

Amount Budgeted: $322,500.00 

Appropriation Required: $75,800.00 

 

CITY MANAGER APPROVAL:  

 

SUMMARY: 

City staff in conjunction with GrantWorks and Jacob & Martin, the assigned Administrator and Engineer 
for a council approved Texas Department of Agriculture (TDA) grant supported project (Oak Street and 

Avenue A Sewer Line Replacement) received one sealed bid on Thursday January 12, 2023, from 
Horseshoe Construction, Inc. in the amount of $398,300.  Total grant and city funds assigned to construction 
are shown in Table 1, totaling $322,500. 

 TDA Grant CDV21-0068 -Construction Budget 

Funding Source Amount 

TxCDBG Grant Funds  $270,000.00  

Approved Match (City)  $  52,500.00  

Approved Funding   $322,500.00  

Additional Local funds  $  75,800.00  

  $398,300.00  

 Expenditures (bid)  
Horshoe Construction Co   $398,300.00  

A shortfall of $75,800.00 exists in order to award the full bid amount and maintain the integrity of the 
proposed sewer line improvements that is partially funded with a grant award. Available funds exist in fund 
balance in the Water/Sewer Fund 30 to support this budget amendment request.   

 

RECOMMENDED ACTION: 

Mayor Pro Tem will ask:  “Madam City Secretary please read the Ordinance Preamble for the record in 
accordance with the City Charter.”  (City Secretary reads preamble) 
 
Mayor Pro Tem calls for a Motion:  Do I have a Motion to approve the second reading of Ordinance 

1352? 

 



ORDINANCE NO.  1352 

 
AN ORDINANCE OF THE CITY OF BRADY, TEXAS AMENDING THE FISCAL 

YEAR 2022-2023 BUDGET FOR MUNICIPAL PURPOSES: 
 
 
An ordinance amending the 2022-2023 Fiscal Year Budget as follows: 
 
  
Increasing the Water / Sewer Fund Expenditure Budget by $75,800 to be assigned to budget line 
item 30-5-31-401.03: Capital Projects- Oak and San Jacinto sewer collection line improvements 
 
  
 
 
NOW, THEREFORE BE IT ORDAINED BY THE CITY COUNCIL OF THE CITY OF 

BRADY TEXAS that the FY 2022-2023 budget be amended accordingly. 
 
 
APPROVED UPON FIRST READING THIS THE  7th DAY OF February 2023, 

 

APPROVED AND PASSED UPON SECOND READING THIS THE 21st DAY OF 

February 2023. 

 

 

 
                                                                                      ____________________________ 
                                                                                        Jane Huffman, Mayor Pro-Tem 
 
 
ATTEST: _____________________________ 
                    Tina Keys, City Secretary 
 

 
 
 



CITY OF BRADY                                                                                  12-6-22

      TOTAL TOTAL FUND 

  FY 23 PROJECTED ENDING FUND BALANCE ADEQUACY REVENUES EXPENSES BALANCE

             

GENERAL FUND  - 10  

 

BEGINNING  FUND   BALANCE  10-1-22 unaudited   $4,050,925

FY 23 Current Budget $8,055,960 $9,251,726 ($1,195,766)

  

    

ENDING   FUND BALANCE  -   9-30-23  $2,855,159

Restricted -ESTIMATE for  fuel inventory ($58,075)

ENDING  FUND BALANCE  - Unrestricted  9-30-23   $2,797,084

Number of days to operating expenditures 124

Excess funds available $759,123

 

Current  budgeted expenditures FY 23 $9,251,726

Less capital expenditures ($986,660)

Net Operating Expenditures $8,265,066

Mimimum level  Fund Balance required $2,037,961 90 days

ELECTRIC  FUND - 20

BEGINNING  FUND   BALANCE  10-1-22 unaudited   $4,533,479

FY 23 Current Budget $7,593,480 $8,441,358 ($847,878)

ENDING   FUND BALANCE - Unrestricted 9-30-23  $3,685,601

Number of days to operating expenditures 172

Excess funds available $462,714

Current  budgeted  expenditures FY 23 $8,441,358

Less  capital expenditures ($599,000)

Operating Expenditures $7,842,358

Mimimum level  Fund Balance required $3,222,887 150 days

WATER / SEWER FUND - 30

BEGINNING  FUND   BALANCE  10-1-22 unaudited   $6,357,897

FY 23 Current Budget $4,570,553 $6,888,974 ($2,318,421)

 

ENDING   FUND BALANCE $4,039,476

Restricted -ESTIMATE for debt service and TWDB commitment ($385,326)

ENDING  FUND BALANCE  - Unrestricted  9-30-23    $3,654,150

Number of days to operating expenditures 312

Excess funds available $1,542,963

Current  budgeted expenditures FY 23 $6,888,974

Less capital expenditures ($2,607,955)

Operating Expenditures $4,281,019

Mimimum level  Fund Balance required $2,111,187 180 days

GAS FUND - 40



CITY OF BRADY                                                                                  12-6-22

      TOTAL TOTAL FUND 

  FY 23 PROJECTED ENDING FUND BALANCE ADEQUACY REVENUES EXPENSES BALANCE

BEGINNING  FUND   BALANCE  10-1-22 unaudited   $481,953

FY 23 Current Budget $1,165,100 $1,156,979 $8,121

ENDING   FUND BALANCE - Unrestricted 9-30-23   $490,074

Number of days to operating expenditures 155

Excess funds available $109,697

Current budgeted  expenditures FY 23 $1,156,979

Less  capital expenditures $0

Operating Expenditures $1,156,979

Mimimum level  Fund Balance required $380,377 120 days

UTILITY SUPPORT FUND -50

BEGINNING  FUND   BALANCE  10-1-22 unaudited   $260,041

FY 23 Current Budget $637,000 $700,686 ($63,686)

 

 

ENDING   FUND BALANCE - Unrestricted 9-30-23 $196,355

Number of days to operating expenditures 111

Excess funds available $37,145

Current budgeted expenditures FY 23  $700,686

Less capital expenditures ($55,000)

Operating Expenditures $645,686

Mimimum level  Fund Balance required $159,210 90 days

SOLID WASTE FUND - 60

BEGINNING  FUND   BALANCE  9-30-22 unaudited   $886,312

FY 23 Current Budget $1,354,000 $1,699,043 ($345,043)

ENDING   FUND BALANCE - Unrestricted 9-30-23   $541,269

Number of days to operating expenditures 132

Excess funds available $173,251

Current budgeted expenditures FY 23 $1,699,043

Less capital expenditures ($206,527)

Operating Expenditures $1,492,516

Mimimum level  Fund Balance required $368,018 90 days

Total Ending  Fund Balances  - Unrestricted $11,364,533

Number of days to Total Operating Expenditures  175



City Council 

City of Brady, Texas 
Agenda Action Form 

 

AGENDA DATE: 02-21-2023 AGENDA ITEM 7.B. 

 

AGENDA 

SUBJECT: 
Discussion, consideration, and possible action regarding recommendation 
for the new Airport EST (water tank) logo. 

PREPARED BY:  S.Miller Date Submitted: 02/13/2023 

 

EXHIBITS: Logo Sketch 

 

BUDGETARY IMPACT: Required Expenditure: $0.00 

Amount Budgeted: $0.00 

Appropriation Required: $0.00 

 

CITY MANAGER 

APPROVAL: 
 

SUMMARY: 

Concerning the new airport water storage tank, it is offered for city council decision to have one side 
labeled as “CURTIS FIELD” for northbound traffic and southbound traffic ‘seeing’ Brady on the 
other side (see exhibit).  Contractor minimum obligation is “BRADY” on two (2) sides. Tank 
contractor has agreed to a no-charge for this specialty logo tank lettering.  

RECOMMENDED ACTION: 

Direct staff as desired. 

 



CURTIS
         FIELD

3'



 

 

City Council 

City of Brady, Texas 
Agenda Action Form 

 

AGENDA DATE: 02/21/2023 AGENDA ITEM 7.C. 

 

AGENDA 

SUBJECT: 
Discussion, consideration, and possible action on awarding lowest 
responsive bid of $398,300 to Horseshoe Construction, Inc., La 
Porte, TX, for the Oak St. & San Jacinto St. sewer line 
improvement project, TX-CDBG Brady CDV21-0068. 

PREPARED BY:  S.Miller  Date Submitted 02/12/2023 

 

EXHIBITS: Bid Tabulation 
Engineer’s Recommendation Letter 
Overall Site Plan (Plan Sheet No. 02) 

 

BUDGETARY 

IMPACT: 
 

Required Expenditure: $  398,300.00 

Amount Budgeted (Grant): $398,000.00 

Appropriation Required: $0.00 

 

CITY MANAGER APPROVAL:  

SUMMARY: 

Sealed bids were properly advertised and received and publicly opened on Thursday 
January 12, 2023, for sewer main improvements located along Oak St. and San Jacinto 
St. for approximately 2,600 linear feet of new six-inch sewer main.  This improvement 
will replace an aging clay line and improve customer sewer service and reliability. 
Horseshoe Construction, Inc. submitted the lowest responsive base bid as shown in the 
exhibit in the amount of $398,300.00.  The bidding proposal was structured to include a 
deductible alternate bid and a short bid summary follows: 

BASE BID $398,300.00 

DEDUCTIBLE ALTERNATE BID $148,055.00 

  

A selection to award base bid including the deductible alternate bid is available.  This 
would reduce the total bid award to $250,245.00.  It is city staff desire to maintain the 
full integrity of the sewer main replacement project at $398,300.00. 

RECOMMENDED ACTION: 

City staff recommends to City Council to award the Oak St. & San Jacinto St. sewer 
main replacement (CDV21-0068) to Horseshoe Construction, Inc. of La Porte, TX, in 
the amount of  the amount of $398,300.00.   

 



 

 

INTEGRITY 

EXCELLENCE 

TRUST 

325.695.1070 
817.594.9880 

info@jacobmartin.com 
www.jacobmartin.com 

3465 Curry Lane 
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Weatherford, TX 76086 

TBPE Firm #: 2448       |       TBAE Firm #: BR 2261       |       TBPLS Firm #: 10024300 – Abilene       |       TBPLS Firm #: 10193992 - Weatherford 

1/27/23 
 
 
Steven Miller 
City of Brady 
201 E Main St 
Brady, TX 76825 
 
Re:  Sewer Line Improvements, TDA Project No. CDV21-0068 Via Email 
 Letter of Recommendation for Award 
 
Dear Mr. Miller: 
 
On January 12, 2023, the City of Brady received bids for the TDA Sewer Line Improvements 
project. One bid was received and a bid tabulation sheet summarizing the bid is included as an 
attachment to this letter. The low base bid was $398,300.00 submitted by Horseshoe 
Construction of La Porte, TX. A deductible alternate bid was also received which, if selected, 
reduces the scope of the project by removing all work on Oak Street (Sheet 3 Station 0+33 to 
Sheet 5 Station 11+79) from the scope of work. This deductible alternate reduces the total 
contract amount to $250,245.00. The total TDA construction budget is $322,500.00  
 
Jacob and Martin has evaluated the low bid for conformity with the advertisement for bids and 
checked the references of the apparent low bidder. Based on our evaluation of the bids, it is 
recommended that the contract be awarded to Horseshoe Construction for the base bid for a 
total contract amount of $398,300.00. If the City agrees with the recommendation for award, 
Jacob and Martin will prepare contract documents for execution by the Contractor and the City. 
Feel free to contact me if you have any questions. 
 
Sincerely, 
Cory Higgins, P.E. 

 
JACOB | MARTIN 

mailto:info@jacobmartin.com


City of Brady

Sewer Line Improvements

Bid Date: January 12, 2023 at 3:00 PM

JM Project Number: 21155

Funding Type: TDA - CDBG  CDV21-0068

Abilene, Texas

Bid Tabulation 

Engineer:  Jacob & Martin, LLC

Abilene, Texas

Item # Item Description Quantity Unit Unit Price Total

1 Mobilization, Bonds, And Insurance 1 LS No Bid No Bid

2 Camera Survey of Existing Sewer Line 1 LS No Bid No Bid

3 6" SDR35 PVC Sewer Line 2,620 LF No Bid No Bid

4 Trench Safety 1,680 LF No Bid No Bid

5 Precast Concrete Manhole 11 EA No Bid No Bid

6 Remove Existing MH 10 EA No Bid No Bid

7 Connection to Sewer Line 1 EA No Bid No Bid

8 Sewer Service Reconnect 21 EA No Bid No Bid

9 Pavement Repair 2,290 LF No Bid No Bid

10 Metal Detectable Tape 2,620 LF No Bid No Bid

No Bid

DEDUCTIBLE ALTERNATE BID SCHEDULE A

Item # Item Description Quantity Unit Unit Price Total

D1 Camera Survey of Existing Sewer Line 1 LS No Bid No Bid

D2 6" SDR35 PVC Sewer Line 1,147 LF No Bid No Bid

D3 Trench Safety 947 LF No Bid No Bid

D4 Precast Concrete Manhole 4 EA No Bid No Bid

D5 Remove Existing MH 3 EA No Bid No Bid

D6 Sewer Service Reconnect 13 EA No Bid No Bid

D7 Pavement Repair 1,180 LF No Bid No Bid

D8 Metal Detectable Tape 1,180 LF No Bid No Bid

No Bid

Item # Item Description Quantity Unit Unit Price Total

1 Mobilization, Bonds, And Insurance 1 LS 15,000.00$   15,000.00$            

2 Camera Survey of Existing Sewer Line 1 LS 20,000.00$   20,000.00$            

3 6" SDR35 PVC Sewer Line - Pipe Burst Install 2,620 LF 65.00$           170,300.00$          

4 Precast Concrete Manhole 10 EA 9,000.00$     90,000.00$            

5 Remove Existing MH 10 EA 1,000.00$     10,000.00$            

6 Connection to Sewer Line 1 EA 1,000.00$     1,000.00$               

7 Sewer Service Reconnect 21 EA 2,000.00$     42,000.00$            

8 Pavement Repair 1 LS 50,000.00$   50,000.00$            

398,300.00$          

DEDUCTIBLE ALTERNATE BID SCHEDULE B

Item # Item Description Quantity Unit Unit Price Total

D1 Camera Survey of Existing Sewer Line 1 LS 2,500.00$     2,500.00$               

D2 6" SDR35 PVC Sewer Line 1,147 LF 65.00$           74,555.00$            

D3 Precast Concrete Manhole 3 EA 9,000.00$     27,000.00$            

D4 Remove Existing MH 3 EA 1,000.00$     3,000.00$               

D5 Sewer Service Reconnect 13 EA 2,000.00$     26,000.00$            

D6 Pavement Repair 1 LS 15,000.00$   15,000.00$            

148,055.00$          TOTAL DEDUCTIBLE ALTERNATE BID SCHEDULE B (ITEMS D1-D6)

TOTAL BASE BID SCHEDULE A (Items 1 - 10)

For all Labor, Materials, Equipment, and Incidentals to Furnish and Install the 

Following:

TOTAL DEDUCTIBLE ALTERNATE BID SCHEDULE A (ITEMS D1-D8)

TOTAL ALTERNATE BASE BID SCHEDULE B (Items 1 - 8)

Horseshoe Construction, Inc.

2309 S. Battleground Rd

La Porte, TX 77571

JM TBPE Firm # 2448

JM TBAE Firm # BR2261

JM TBPLS Firm # 10194493 1 of 1





 

 

City Council 

City of Brady, Texas 
Agenda Action Form 

 

AGENDA DATE: 02/21/2023 AGENDA ITEM 7.D. 

 

AGENDA 

SUBJECT: 
Discussion, consideration and possible action to approve Hotel 
Occupancy Tax (HOT) Funding Application from the TruCountry 
Music Show to be held April 7-8, 2023 
 

PREPARED BY:  E. Corbell Date Submitted: 2/8/2023 

 

EXHIBITS: HOT Funding Application 

 

BUDGETARY IMPACT: Required Expenditure: $0.00 

Budget Amount Available: $0.00 

Appropriation Required: $0.00 

 

CITY MANAGER 

APPROVAL: 
 

SUMMARY: 

Ordinance 1262 passed on 12/4/2018 established the Tourism Advisory Board and set the guidelines 
for the Board.  Ordinance 1263 passed on February 5, 2019 added HOT Tax Grant applications and 
recordkeeping as duties of the Tourism Advisory Board including making recommendations to 
Council for HOT Tax Grant applications.  The City did advertise in the Brady Standard Herald asking 
for volunteers for the Tourism Advisory Board but no applications were received.  With the absence 
of the Tourism Advisory Board, Staff if requesting Council approve HOT Tax Grant applications. 
 
The Chamber of Commerce has budgeted $22,000 for tourism grants for this fiscal year, as approved 
by the City Council. The Chamber is bringing to council one grant application for the TruCountry 
Music Show in the amount of $5,000. 
 

 

RECOMMENDED ACTION: 

Consider and approve an amount to award to TruCountry Music Show be held April 7 – 8, 2023. 

 























 

 

City Council 

City of Brady, Texas 
Agenda Action Form 

 

AGENDA DATE: 02/21/2023 AGENDA ITEM 7.E. 

 

AGENDA 

SUBJECT: 
Discussion, consideration and possible action to approve Hotel 
Occupancy Tax (HOT) Funding Application from the Heart of Texas 
Country Music Association for the annual Heart of Texas Country 
Music Festival. 
 

PREPARED BY:  E. Corbell Date Submitted: 02/14/2023 

 

EXHIBITS: HOT Funding Application 

 

BUDGETARY IMPACT: Required Expenditure: $0.00 

Budget Amount Available: $0.00 

Appropriation Required: $0.00 

 

CITY MANAGER 

APPROVAL: 
 

SUMMARY: 

Ordinance 1262 passed on 12/4/2018 established the Tourism Advisory Board and set the guidelines 
for the Board.  Ordinance 1263 passed on February 5, 2019 added HOT Tax Grant applications and 
recordkeeping as duties of the Tourism Advisory Board including making recommendations to 
Council for HOT Tax Grant applications.  The City did advertise in the Brady Standard Herald asking 
for volunteers for the Tourism Advisory Board but no applications were received.  With the absence 
of the Tourism Advisory Board, Staff if requesting Council approve HOT Tax Grant applications. 
 
The Chamber of Commerce has budgeted $22,000 for tourism grants for this fiscal year, as approved 
by the City Council. The Chamber is bringing to council one grant application for the Heart of Texas 
Country Music Festival in the amount of $10,000. 
 

 

RECOMMENDED ACTION: 

Consider and approve an amount to award to the Heart of Texas Country Music Association for the 
annual Heart of Texas Country Music Festival. 

 















 

 

City Council 

City of Brady, Texas 
Agenda Action Form 

 

AGENDA DATE: 02/21/2023 AGENDA ITEM 7.F. 

 

AGENDA 

SUBJECT: 
Discussion, consideration and possible action to approve the use of 
City held Hotel Occupancy Tax funds to support production costs for 
“Cal’s Hometown Revival” 
 

PREPARED BY:  E. Corbell Date Submitted: 2/8/2023 

 

EXHIBITS: Promotional Brochure, Promotional Video 

 

BUDGETARY IMPACT: Required Expenditure: $15,000.00 

Budget Amount Available: $19,500.00 

Appropriation Required: $0.00 

 

CITY MANAGER 

APPROVAL: 
 

SUMMARY: 

The City of Brady has been approached to partner with Calina Mishay for a television production 
entitled “Cal’s Hometown Revival”, where the mural artist features communities that she has painted 
murals in or the production of new murals in the community. 
 
More information can be found in the attached brochure and at www.calshometownrevival.com. 
 
The amount requested pays for production costs associated with the show to highlight existing murals. 
The City of Brady and Visit Brady will have access to all raw footage shot for up to a year for the use 
in their own creative content. Brady will be featured on a “passport” map featuring all of Calina’s 
highlighted murals. There will also be a hosted viewing for the City of Brady once CoB’s episode is 
complete. 
 

 

RECOMMENDED ACTION: 

Approved an expenditure of $15,000 to support production expenses associated with “Cal’s 
Hometown Revival. 

 





OCT. NOV. DEC. JAN. FEB. MARCH APR MAY JUNE JULY AUG. SEPT.

Days Meals Served 20 19 20 21 19 22 21 20 22 22 21 21

Average Daily Meals

Meals  @ Sunset Center 454          429          456          461          

Home Delivered Meals 669          697          692          679          

Total Meals 1,123       1,126       1,148       1,140       -                -                -                -                -                -                -                -                

Closed Nov. 26 & 27 for Thanksgiving, Nov. 11 Veteran's Day

OCT. NOV. DEC. JAN. FEB. MARCH APR MAY JUNE JULY AUG. SEPT.

Days Meals Served 22 18 20 22 19 22 21 20 22 22 21 21

Average Daily Meals

Meals  @ Sunset Center 521          486          525          453          327          505          406          462          554          465          515          495          

Home Delivered Meals 686          651          672          630          408          769          694          696          704          635          845          682          

Total Meals 1,207       1,137       1,197       1,083       735          1,274       1,100       1,158       1,258       1,100       1,360       1,177       

Closed Nov. 28 & 29 for Thanksgiving, Nov. 11 Veteran's Day

Center Center Meals Served

Director Rosie Aguirre

Monthly Report October 2022-September 2023

Closed  Memorial Day Closed (Labor Day)

Closed  for Christmas Closed July 4th

Closed Jan. 1st - New Years Day

Closed Feb. 

250

5,714                            

8,072                            

13,786                         

Closed Oct. 14-Columbus Day Closed  Good Friday

Closed  for Christmas Closed July 4th

Closed Jan. 1st - New Years Day

Closed Feb. 

SERVICES
FISCAL YEAR 2021-2022

To Date Total

Closed  Memorial Day Closed (Labor Day)

SERVICES
FISCAL YEAR 2022-2023

To Date Total

248

1,800                            

2,737                            

4,537                            

Closed Oct. 12-Columbus Day Closed  Good Friday



Brady Municipal Golf Course

Monthly Report

FY 2023

Item Oct Nov Dec Jan Feb Mar Apr May Jun Jul Aug Sep TOTAL

Rounds 368 69 57 95 589

Green Fees 2,190.00$           985.00$            886.00$            1,582.00$         5,643.00$           

Membership Rounds 368 197 177 271 1013

Student Rounds 22 2 9 27 60

Total Rounds 546 268 243 393 1450

Trail Fee 0 0 0

Trail Fee Revenues -$                    -$                  -$                    

Cart Rentals 154 61 39 99 353

Cart Revenue 2,376.73$           962.05$            704.60$            1,639.56$         5,682.94$           

Cart Shed Rental

Vending Revenue 1,103.53$           148.45$            303.62$            778.99$            2,334.59$           

Memberships 71 22 29 24 146

Membership Fees 19,860.00$         2,985.00$         1,435.00$         2,345.00$         26,625.00$         

Driving Range 26 17 11 34 88

Range Revenue 96.04$                56.16$              44.80$              144.50$            341.50$              

Misc. -$                    -$                    

Total Revenue 25,626.30$     5,136.66$     3,374.02$     6,490.05$     -$              -$              -$              -$              -$              -$              -$              -$              40,627.03$     

None of the above figures includes sales tax

Item FY 2023

Rounds 

Green Fees

Membership Rounds

Student Rounds

Total Rounds

Trail Fee

Trail Fee Revenues

Cart Rentals

Cart Revenue

Cart Shed Rental

Vending Revenue

Memberships

Membership Fees

Driving Range

Range Revenue

Misc.

Total Revenue -$                    



GOLF COURSE - 05
Date Cash Gross Sales Cash Taxable Sales Credit Gross Sales Credit Taxable Sales

1/1/2023 $78.65 $63.40 $312.74 $165.49

1/2/2023 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00

1/3/2023 $36.68 $16.68 $22.52 $12.52

1/4/2023 $35.41 $23.16 $0.00 $0.00

1/5/2023 $5.33 $2.08 $7.33 $5.08

1/6/2023 $36.11 $27.11 $38.52 $18.52

1/7/2023 $232.45 $128.45 $318.60 $129.35

1/8/2023 $96.14 $52.89 $137.56 $37.56

1/9/2023 $29.79 $19.79 $105.36 $63.38

1/10/2023 $14.24 $3.24 $82.53 $52.53

1/11/2023 $5.00 $0.00 $25.60 $14.60

1/12/2023 $11.00 $0.00 $50.37 $27.12

1/13/2023 $106.01 $85.26 $166.40 $121.90

1/14/2023 $156.48 $100.23 $456.07 $199.32

1/15/2023 $92.75 $53.00 $216.61 $109.86

1/16/2023 $5.95 $3.70 $60.93 $27.68

1/17/2023 $49.68 $16.68 $44.14 $14.14

1/18/2023 $73.02 $42.02 $0.00 $0.00

1/19/2023 $40.34 $27.09 $2.08 $2.08

1/20/2023 $55.09 $36.59 $3.70 $3.70

1/21/2023 $92.06 $52.06 $327.53 $185.28

1/22/2023 $104.64 $59.64 $100.79 $90.29

1/23/2023 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00

1/24/2023 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00

1/25/2023 $0.00 $0.00 $2.08 $2.08

1/26/2023 $1.00 $0.00 $25.52 $15.52

1/27/2023 $68.33 $41.58 $5.19 $5.19

1/28/2023 $7.94 $6.94 $16.68 $16.68

1/29/2023 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00

1/30/2023 $0.00 $0.00 $3.08 $3.08

1/31/2023 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00

Total $1,434.09 $861.59 $2,531.93 $1,322.95

Manager Signature Total Gross Sales: $3,966.02



CALLS 2022-2023 OCT NOV DEC JAN FEB MAR APR MAY JUNE JULY AUG SEPT TOTALS

RUNS 72 110 99 107

INSURANCE Y-32   N-6 Y-53 N-14 58 45

ALS  38 61 63 55

BLS 27 47 25 37

ALS FALL 7 6 7 7

BLS FALL 10 17 13 12

TRAUMA 20 38 15 21

TRAUMA DEATH 1 0 0 0

D.O.A. 1 0 1 2

M.V.A. CITY 4 0 1 0

M.V.A. COUNTY 4 5 1 5

FIRE CITY 5 3 8 9

FIRE COUNTY 4 2 0 4

HELICOPTER 1 1 2 3

HELICOPTER REFUSAL 0 1 0 0

COUNTY CALLS 17 22 16 26

CANCEL 0 3 1 3

TRANSFER 0 2 0 0

REFUSAL 27 40 23 33

GAS LEAK 0 0 0 2

MEDICAL ALARM 0 2 1 4

FIRE ALARM 1 1 3 1

LIFT ASSIST 3 5 0 0

OVER 20 MINUTES 25 46 44 33

OTHER 0 0 0 0

B.V.F.D. CITY 2 3 6 5

B.V.F.D. COUNTY 13 2 6 22



TO: BRADY CITY COUNCIL

FROM: Letha Moore Customer Service Billing Manager

THROUGH: Erin Corbel, CITY MANAGER

SUBJECT: MONTHLY ANIMAL CONTROL REPORT 

  FISCAL YEAR 2022-2023

Oct Nov Dec Jan Feb Mar Apr May Jun Jul Aug Sep Total

Number of Calls 78 88 81 87 334

Feral Cats Picked Up 6 13 8 8 35

Stray Dogs Picked Up 19 14 18 31 82

Owner Surrendered Dogs 0 3 0 0 3

Owner Surrendered Cats 0 0 0 0 0

Bite Reports 0 0 0 0 0

Dogs Deemed Dangerous 0 0 0 0 0

Hit by Car Picked Up 1 1 0 0 2

Owner Reclaims 7 3 3 2 15

Euthanized Total 4 2 3 8 17

Rescue Pull Total 9 14 5 15 43

Wildlife Pick Up 0 1 0 1 2

Quarantine 0 0 0 0 0

Shelter Intake Total 25 27 18 31 101

Roadkill 4 1 0 5 10

Citations 0 1 0 0 1

Warnings 0 1 1 3 5

Adoptions 0 0 0 1 1

Total Calls 78 88 81 105 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 352











Municipal Court Monthly Report 

JANUARY 2023 

Criminal Section Civil Section Total Cases 

Non-Parking Traffic Parking City Ordinance Penal Code Non-Traffic State Law City Ordinance 1. Total Cases Pending First of Month 314

1. Total Cases Pending First of the Month: 2,829 1 0 1,397 8 88    a. Active Cases 270

   a. Active Cases 1,659 1 0 919 5 77    b. Inactive Cases 44

   b. Inactive Cases 1170 0 0 478 3 11 2. New Cases Filed 1

2. New Cases Filed 85 0 0 15 0 1 3. Cases Reactivated 0

3. Cases Reactivated 61 0 0 63 0 0 4. All other Cases Added 0

4. All other Cases Added 0 0 0 0 0 0 5. Total Cases On Docket 271

5. Total Cases on Docket 1,805 1 0 997 5 78 6. Uncontested Civil Fines or Penalties 11

6. Dispositions Prior to Court Appearance or Trial: 7. Default Judgments 4

   a. Uncontested Dispositions 37 0 0 0 0 1 8. Agreed Judgments 0

   b. Dismissed by Prosecuton 0 0 0 0 0 0 9. Tiral/Hearing by Judge/Offiver 0

7. Dispositions at Trial: 10. Tiral By Jury 0

    a. Convictions: 11. Dismissed for Want of  Prosecution 0

         1) Guilty Peal or Nolo Contendere 3 0 0 9 0 2 12. All Other Dispositions 0

         2)By the Court 0 0 0 0 0 0 13. Total Cases Disposed 15

         3) By the Jury 0 0 0 0 0 0 14. Cases Placed on Inactive Status 0

    b. Acquittals: 15. Total Cases Pending End of Month: 300

         1) By the Court 0 0 0 0 0 0    a. Active Cases 256

         2) By the Jury 0 0 0 0 0 0    b. Inactive Cases 44

    c. Dismissed by Prosecution 0 0 0 0 0 0 16. Cases Appealed: 

8. Compliance Dismissals:    a. After Trial 0

   a. After Driver Safety Course 4    b. Without Trial 0

   b. After Deferred Disposition 0 0 0 0 0 0

   c. After Teen Court 0 0 0 0 0 0 Juvenile/ Minor Activity Total 

   d. After Tobacco Awareness Course 0 1. Transportation Code Cases Filed 0

   e. After Treatment for Chemical Dependency 0 0 2. Non-driving Alcoholic Beverage Code Cases Filed 2

   f. After Proof of Financial Responsibility 1 3. Driving Under the Influence of Alcohol Cases Filed 0

   g. All other Trasportation Code Dismissals 6 0 0 0 0 0 4. Drug Paraphernalia Cases Filed 0

9. All other Dispositions 0 0 0 0 0 0 5. Tobacco Cases Filed 0

10. Total Cases Disposed 51 0 0 17 0 3 6. Truancy Cases Filed 0

11. Cases Places on Inactive Status 42 0 0 2 0 0 7. Education Code (Except Failur to Attend) Cases Filed 0

12. Total Cases Pending End of Month: 2,863 1 0 1,395 8 86 8. Curfew 0

   a. Active Cases 1,712 1 0 978 5 75 9. All other Non-Traffic Fine- Only Cases Filed 0

   b. Inactive Cases 1,151 0 0 417 3 11 10. Transfer to Juvenile Court: 

13. Show Cause Hearings Held 1 0 0 0 0 4    a. Mandatory Transfer 0

14. Cases Appealed:    b. Discretionary Transfer 0

   a. After Trial 0 0 0 0 0 0 11. Accused of Contemp and Referred to Juvenile Court 0

   b. Without Trial 0 0 0 0 0 0 12. Held in Contempt by Criminal Court 0

13. Juvenile Statement Magistrate Warning: 

Total    a.Warnings Administered 0

   b. Statements Certified 0

2 14. Detention Hearings Held 0

6 15. Orders for Non-Secure Custody Issues 0

7 16. Parents Contributing to Nonattendance Cases Filed 0

1

$72.00

$9,453.75

$5,139.72

$14,593.47
50

   c. Total 
Arrest Warrants Issued 

Cases in Which Fine and Court Costs Satisfied by Jail Credit 

Cases in Which Fine and Court Costs Waived for Indigency 

Amount of Fines and Court Costs Waived for Indigency

18. Fines, Court Costs and Other Amounts Collected:

   a. Kept By City 

   b. Remitted to State 

Traffic Traffic Non-Traffic

Additional Activity 

Cases in Which a Fine and Court Costs Satisfied by Community Service 

   a. Partial Satisfaction 

   b. Full Satisfaction 

Presiding Judge: Justin Tyler Owens 
Prepared by Court Clerk Valerie Gonzalez 

Official Report Submitted to The Office of Court Administration 02-06-2023 
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